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RESPONSE

I would like to make a freedom of information request for
the number of people in your LA currently in council tax
arrears.

1.

The number of people in council tax arrears in your LA
May 2022/2023.

The number of people in council tax arrears in your LA
2018/20109.

The number of liability orders made in 2023/24 in your
LA.
The number of liability orders made in 2022/23 in your
LA.
The number of liability orders made in 2021/22 in your
LA.

1. Number of persons in arrears is not recorded
and we are unable to report this
retrospectively.

2. Number of persons in arrears is not recorded
and we are unable to report this
retrospectively.

3. 13665

4. 14856

5. 13840




