

I would like to request:

1. The current list of approved suppliers of temporary accommodation that the council will use to procure from.

If the council does not hold a list of approved suppliers I would like to request:

2. The full list of suppliers of temporary accommodation that was procured from in the financial year 2023-24. If data for 2023-24 is not yet available, then this should be provided for 2022-23.

If the council uses contractors to manage their own stock of temporary accommodation I would like to request:

3. The current list of approved contractors used to manage temporary accommodation that the council will use to procure from.

If the council do not hold a list of approved contractors I would like to request:

4. The full list of contractors used to manage temporary accommodation that was procured from in the financial year 2023-24. If data for 2023-24 is not yet available, then this should be provided for 2022-23.

For suppliers of temporary accommodation, I would like to request:

- 5. For the financial year 2023/24 the total actual spend with each supplier.
- 6. For the financial year 2022/23 the total actual spend with each supplier.
- 7. For the financial year 2021/22 the total actual spend with each supplier.

If data is not available for 2023/24 then I would request the most recent three years when data is available.

For contractors who are used to manage the council's own supply of temporary accommodation, I would like to request:

- 8. For the financial year 2023/24 the total actual spend with each contractor.
- 9. For the financial year 2022/23 the total actual spend with each contractor.
- 10. For the financial year 2021/22 the total actual spend with each contractor.

If data is not available for 2023/24 then I would request the most recent three years when data is available.

- 1. We do not have an approved list of providers.
- 2. The attached document outlines the housing providers used for temporary accommodation. This does not include details of hotels or B&Bs used as placements for temporary accommodation as we do not disclose these locations given the risk and vulnerabilities that can be associated with placements requiring emergency accommodation and disclosing this could put the provider and placement at risk.
- 3. We do not use contractors to manage our own stock all of our stock is managed in house, this includes stock used for temporary accommodation.
- 4. The attached document outlines the housing providers used for temporary accommodation. This does not include details of hotels or B&Bs used as placements for temporary accommodation as we do not disclose these locations given the risk and vulnerabilities that can be associated with placements requiring emergency accommodation and disclosing this could put the provider and placement at risk.
- 5. See attached document which outlines spend on housing providers used for temporary accommodation in 23/24. This does not include details of hotels or B&Bs used as placements for temporary accommodation as we do not disclose these locations given the risk and vulnerabilities that can be associated with placements requiring emergency accommodation and disclosing this could put the provider and placement at risk.
- 6. See attached document which outlines spend on housing providers used for temporary accommodation in 22/23. This does not include details of hotels or B&Bs used as placements for temporary accommodation as we do not disclose these locations given the risk and vulnerabilities that can be associated with placements requiring emergency accommodation and disclosing this could put the provider and placement at risk.
- 7. See attached document which outlines spend on housing providers used for temporary accommodation in 21/22. This does not include details of hotels or B&Bs used as placements for temporary accommodation as we do not disclose these locations given the risk and vulnerabilities that can be associated with placements requiring emergency accommodation and disclosing this could put the provider and placement at risk.
- 8. Not applicable
- 9. Not applicable
- 10. Not applicable

FOI 17482

2021/22
2022/23
2023/24

TA Provider
Value (£)
TA Provider
Value (£)
TA Provider
Value (£)
Value